
 

DOUGLAS COUNTY SCHOOL SYSTEM   ~   RELEASE / EMERGENCY MEDICAL FORM 
 

PLEASE READ CAREFULLY   

 
EMERGENCY MEDICAL AUTHORIZATION 

 

Student: ______________________________ Home Phone: ______________ Address: _____________________________________ 
 

Mother’s Name: ___________________Bus. Phone: ___________ Father’s Name: __________________ Bus. Phone: ____________ 
  

Family Physician: ____________________ Phone: ______________   Dentist: ____________________ Phone: _________________ 
 

Insurance Company: ______________________________________   Policy # ________________    Group # ___________________ 
 

WHOM CAN WE CONTACT IF NO PARENT/GUARDIAN CAN BE REACHED TO ASSUME RESPONSIBILITY 
FOR THIS STUDENT?    

 

       Name: _____________________________________Phone: ______________________ 
 

Activities Agreement 

To insure the proper atmosphere for interscholastic competition, the participant and his/her parents or guardians must understand and 
cooperate in helping establish that atmosphere by adhering to all school rules and regulations.  When a violation of school rules occurs 
proper steps will be taken.  A participant may be suspended from participating in interscholastic activities or from a team for violating any of 
the following standards: (1) falsification of physician’s signature, parent or guardian’s signature, any information pertaining to school 
enrollment, school records, or interscholastic activity forms; (2) use of, possession of, or distribution of alcohol or tobacco; misuse of non-
prescription drugs, or of controlled substances; (3) theft or destruction to property of any school or individual; (4) repeated acts of 
unsportsmanlike conduct;  (5) failure to follow rules as set for individual activities by coaches. 
 

A student must have his/her parent’s or guardian’s signed permission to participate.  All athletic participation requires a physical examination 
with the doctor’s permission to participate.  The participant is required to abide by the rules and regulations of the State Board of Education, 
the Douglas County Board of Education, and the Georgia High School Association. 
 

Informed Consent  

We realize that such activities involve the potential for injury to our son or daughter which is inherent in all activities.  We acknowledge that 
even with the best coaching, use of the most advanced protective equipment, and strict observance of rules, injuries to our son/daughter are 
still a possibility.  We recognize that on rare occasions these injuries to our son/daughter can be so severe as to result in total disability, 
paralysis or even death. 
 

Drug Testing Consent (High School Only) 

We understand that submission to testing for the presence of drugs and alcohol is a condition of participation in privileged activities in the 
Douglas County School System.  We further understand that refusal to take the test, failure to report for the test, or if the test establishes a 
violation of the drug testing policy, our son/daughter will be subject to consequences as set forth by the drug testing policy. 
 

General Release 

It is anticipated that my son/daughter, while a participant in interscholastic activities in the Douglas County School System, will travel to 
many activities off campus.  Transportation for my child to these off campus activities may be school buses, private vehicles, or alternate 
transportation operated by employees or agents of the School System.  In consideration of their performing this valuable service for me and 
my child, I hereby release and discharge any and all claims and causes of action of any kind or nature which may arise out of my child’s 
travel while at school both for myself and my minor child.  It is the express intent of this release to forever hold the Douglas County School 
System, its agents and employees, harmless for any injuries which may occur to my child as a result of travel while he or she is in the 
custody of the School System. 
 

Insurance Waiver 

I fully understand that the Douglas County School System does not provide any insurance and it is my responsibility to provide insurance 
coverage for my son/daughter.  The Douglas County School System will not assume liability for injuries incurred by my son/daughter during 
participation in or practice of any interscholastic activity. 
 

A parent/guardian may elect to enroll the participant in a supplemental school insurance program which is authorized by the Douglas County 
School System.  If you choose to purchase coverage through this plan, contact the school principal or head coach for additional information. 
 

Authorization: 

In case of an emergency or accident during any school activity involving my child, which in the opinion of school authorities present requires 
immediate medical or surgical attention, I authorize the school to take such emergency actions as may be deemed necessary, including the 
transportation of the student to a hospital or medical center and authorizing medical treatment.  I hereby grant permission, also to said 
physician to treat said condition unless I am present and request otherwise. I assume the responsibility for any medical expenses incurred 
during this emergency.   The coach, school, or the Douglas County School System will not be held responsible for any medical expenses. 
 

Permission to Participate: 
I have carefully read and understand each of the above section and will comply with these policies or statement. 

Permission is granted to my son/daughter to practice and complete in interscholastic activities. 
 

 

 

Parent/ Guardian Signature     Student Signature 

________________________________ Date: ____/_____/______   _______________________________ Date: _____/_____/______ 

        Mo.    Day     Year         Mo.    Day     Year 
  

Revised 2019 


